
MOTHER’S DAY 
John 16:16-24



16 “A little while, and you will see me no longer; and 
again a little while, and you will see me.” 17 So some 
of his disciples said to one another, “What is this that 
he says to us, ‘A little while, and you will not see me, 
and again a little while, and you will see me’; and, 
‘because I am going to the Father’?” 18 So they were 
saying, “What does he mean by ‘a little while’? We do 
not know what he is talking about.” 19 Jesus knew that 
they wanted to ask him, so he said to them, “Is this 
what you are asking yourselves, what I meant by 
saying, ‘A little while and you will not see me, and 
again a little while and you will see me’?

JOHN 16:16-24



20 Truly, truly, I say to you, you will weep and lament, 
but the world will rejoice. You will be sorrowful, but 
your sorrow will turn into joy. 21 When a woman is 
giving birth, she has sorrow because her hour has 
come, but when she has delivered the baby, she no 
longer remembers the anguish, for joy that a human 
being has been born into the world. 22 So also you 
have sorrow now, but I will see you again, and your 
hearts will rejoice, and no one will take your joy from 
you.

JOHN 16:16-24



23 In that day you will ask nothing of me. Truly, truly, I 
say to you, whatever you ask of the Father in my 
name, he will give it to you. 24  Until now you have 
asked nothing in my name. Ask, and you will receive, 
that your joy may be full.

JOHN 16:16-24



16 “A little while, and you will see me no longer; and 
again a little while, and you will see me.” 17 So some 
of his disciples said to one another, “What is this that 
he says to us, ‘A little while, and you will not see me, 
and again a little while, and you will see me’; and, 
‘because I am going to the Father’?” 18 So they were 
saying, “What does he mean by ‘a little while’? We do 
not know what he is talking about.” 19 Jesus knew that 
they wanted to ask him, so he said to them, “Is this 
what you are asking yourselves, what I meant by 
saying, ‘A little while and you will not see me, and 
again a little while and you will see me’?

JOHN 16:16-24



20 Truly, truly, I say to you, you will weep and lament, 
but the world will rejoice. You will be sorrowful, but 
your sorrow will turn into joy. 21 When a woman is 
giving birth, she has sorrow because her hour has 
come, but when she has delivered the baby, she no 
longer remembers the anguish, for joy that a human 
being has been born into the world. 22 So also you 
have sorrow now, but I will see you again, and your 
hearts will rejoice, and no one will take your joy from 
you.

JOHN 16:16-24



21  When a woman is giving birth, she has sorrow 
because her hour has come, but when she has 
delivered the baby, she no longer remembers the 
anguish, for joy that a human being has been born 
into the world.

JOHN 16:16-24



41 So they took away the stone. And Jesus lifted up his 
eyes and said, “Father, I thank you that you have 
heard me. 42  I knew that you always hear me, but I 
said this on account of the people standing around, 
that they may believe that you sent me.” 43 When he 
had said these things, he cried out with a loud voice, 
“Lazarus, come out.” 44 The man who had died came 
out, his hands and feet bound with linen strips, and 
his face wrapped with a cloth. Jesus said to them, 
“Unbind him, and let him go.”

JOHN 11:41-44



23 In that day you will ask nothing of me. Truly, truly, I 
say to you, whatever you ask of the Father in my 
name, he will give it to you. 24  Until now you have 
asked nothing in my name. Ask, and you will receive, 
that your joy may be full.

JOHN 16:16-24


